Office of theTown Clerk
Diane M. Wilhelm

Registrar of Vital Statistics Records Management Officer Marriage Officer

TO: Supervisor Walter, Councilpersons Dunleavy, Wooten, Gabrielsen, Giglio,
Engineering, Maryann Tague

FROM: Julie O’Neill, Deputy Town Clerk
DATE: December 18, 2014
RE: Open Bid Report for Street Lighting Parts

7 bids were received and opened on December 18, 2014 at 11:00am:
Too many items to list, see attached

City Energy Services Louis Shiffman Electric
2221-7 5t Avenue 542 Wortman Ave
Ronkonkoma NY 11779 Brooklyn NY 11208
631 588-4801 718 441-4200

Traffic Systems Inc
Formed Plastics, Inc. 224 N Fehr Way
207 Stonehinge Ln Bay Shore NY 11706
Carl Place NY 11514 631 242-4292
516 334-2300

A Division of WESCO Dist.
Avon Electrical Supplies

Kelly and Hayes Electrical Supply of LI, Inc. 60 Hoffman Avenue
66 Southern Blvd. Hauppauge, NY 11788
Nesconset, NY 11767 631-520-1298

631-467-3939

Schwing Electrical Supply Corp.
1328 E. Main Street

Riverhead, NY 11901
631-727-1155



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET

COMPANY NAME: ___ € 1Y B nlY (EeVItEL
COMPANY ADDRESS: 2221 -7 Sth AvF
Rowwoisenl)  NY (1779

COMPANY TELEPHONE: L3i- 588 -~ ipo i

COMPANY FAX: E£2i- 588 —tosy

COMPANY CONTACT: PO kbrE

TOTAL AMOUNT IN WORDS: MKM ,i;.;eﬁw wﬁ*f /Iawﬂ%” 7‘/‘““% fre
TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED I o
DATE: 3 2] y )

SIGNED: ,/g;:

PRINT NAME: %ﬁn/ k&

TITLE: Ve Saregs

ZABIDS 2014014 BID.STREET LIGHTING.doex ~ COMPANY NAME C iW @W 9



ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# ) (APPROXIMATE) | COST
BULBS — MEDIUM BASE ¥
Bl 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30 6.5 | 1£2.50
B2 100W MH (M90) — COURT PARKING 60 G,86 | 5§83, co
B3 150W HPS LU (C150S68) 24 6.5¢ | 18¢.09
B4 150W MH (M102) —- COURT PARKING 60 Q. 8% | enr. co
BULBS - MODUL BASE - HPS LU (CLR) ¥ -
B5 70W (C70S62) 50 625 | 312.8
B6 100W (C100S54) 50 6:25 | 4n.So
B7 150W (C150S55) 50 6. 5¢ | 325, e
B8 250W (C250S50) 50 &.495 | 34750
B9 400W (C400S51) 12 6. 95| %3.40
B10 1000W (C1000S52) 12 35,25 | 423.00
BULBS - METAL HALIDE 55 )
Bll 175W (MH175/U) 50 Q.GCo | 475 eo
B12 250W (MH 250/U) 12 Q.28 | 1lil.co
B13 400W MH (H33) - MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12 ase | ijle.ov
B14 1000W (MH1000/U) 6 21.75| (3e.60
B15 1500W (MH1500/BU) — RECREATION 6 23.49¢ | iW3uo
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL
B17 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 NE[3.D
B18 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 vl
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS
ONLY)
Tl 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12 Ne (DD
T2 100W (C100S54) 6
T3 150W (C150855) 6 /
T4 250W (C250S50) 6 /
T5 400W (C400S510) 6 /
T6 1000W (C100S52) 6 v
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE i ,
T7 100W (MH100) — COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 35 . ic | Y.
T8 150W (MH150) —- COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 43,60 | §21 20
T9 175W (MH175/U) - MOGUL 6 2128 | 139, ¢
T10 250W (MH 250/U) — MOGUL 6 26:25 | 207,60 |
T11 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT - MOGUL 6 1476 | 232.8%
T12 1000W (MH 1000/U) — MOGUL 6 Tbag | 46280
T13 1500W (MH 1500/BU) —- MOBUL 6 ile.tS 723 4o
PHOTO CELLS ]
PC1 PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300 ]
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105- '7. qs 229576
308 (BROWN OR GREY)  RQupigy &¥pTF 7
PC2 TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET — 30862 | 24 ,
MULBERRY faeLty  S5420 14.25 “4bL.ec
ZABIDS 201414 BIDSTREET LIGHTING.does  COMPANY NAME & g7~ 54} i%@é;-f/ §'g—’é}~"~ U’[ ez 8 10
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# APPROXIMATE | COST
FIXTURES AND POLES
F1 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6 wo | B
F2 70W HPS LU M2ACO7SIN2LMS21 Quuriwé G2 | 24 02 50| 2.493.4¢
F3 150W HPS LU M2AC15SIN2LMS21 24 /03, 6 | 2 6060
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12 in.a95 | icsqp
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50 3 %4.6¢] 16,445 .06
F6 ERS10AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50 L0900 | it 4S8 .60
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 q3xy e il gres
F8 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 q35.¢0 | j' S
F9 T10R07S1H2LMS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP{ | 12 1552 193,60
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 93¢, ¢ | 1) 0
F1l1 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 Rew | i e
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) ? 24 Y96, 52 i1 .o8
REFRACTORS & GLOBES /
R1 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( 6 o i
FP118-8) /
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG 6 /
FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC)
R3 VH65AB-3N-PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO | 12
FIXTURE) é
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 8| weq.gd
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE AT 1 & | 50 476 | 237, 8¢
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE ATy 20 | 50 75 | "237.%
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE A tm 3¢ | 50 H75| 2378
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS )
TSI 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12 el 5.0
TS2 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12 .,
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 12 /
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 12
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 12
TS6 12” DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12 /
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12 /
TS8 12° ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12 /
CABINET ACCESSORIES /
Cl CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) 1
(CONTROLLER, PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR,
ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST OF ITEMS AND
PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER)
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1 /
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDINSM | 1 /
3L)
C4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- | 1 /
82-06) /
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1 W

Z)\BIDS.2014\14.BID.STREETLIGHTING.doex ~ COMPANY NAME MMM{



LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS Ne Bip
L1 T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6
COORDINATION UNIT /
L2 T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6 /
L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6 /
COUNTDOWN, LED
L4 T10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6 /
L5 T12LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC | 6 /
SIGNAL SECTIONS
L6 T16 PDC 200 (4) — LOAD SWITCHES 6
L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) - FLASHER 6 /
v
BOLLARDS
BLI BF1 VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12 MO Bip
PARK) 7
OWK-3-8842-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB j
BL2 ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (15T ST 12 /
FLD)
BL3 VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12 /
OWK 1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK
MISCELLANEOQUS /
Ml 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE % W X 60’(BLACK) 6 /
M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %> X 60° (RED) 6 /
M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (WHITE) 6 /
M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE ¥ X 60’ (BLUE) 6
M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (GREEN) 6 /
M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6 /
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500° 6 /
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M3 THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500° 6
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
MI10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315’ ROLLS 2
M1l WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3 M R/Y BULK 3 //
RED/YELLOW SPRING /
M12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3 75
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING K

Z3BIDS 201414 BID.STREETLIGHTING.doox ~ COMPANY NAME & ¢ 1¢* r‘;&m SE’{‘V/ (7 -
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET
COMPANY NAME: __ Foemco Piasties T
COMPANY ADDRESS: 0% Smovevhiwir L.
Corcs Pinee, py usiy
COMPANY TELEPHONE: $ib_ 339 2300
COMPANY FAX: S 334 AL39
COMPANY CONTACT: Vavio Loy ¢

TOTAL AMOUNT IN WORDS: Ove_ Torusae Evr Hyeoeen Foeny Five avp =0

TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED
DATE: b | Y
SIGNED: V. ‘(

- /
PRINT NAME: Davie Lave
TITLE: Ececorive VP

ZABIDS.2014\14 BID.STREET.LIGETING.oex ~  COMPANY NAME 60“750 P\A $TIcs Tt




ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# (APPROXIMATE) | COST
BULBS — MEDIUM BASE
Bl 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30 Ason e
B2 100W MH (M90) — COURT PARKING 60 SV TR
B3 150W HPS LU (C150S68) 24 :
B4 150W MH (M102) —- COURT PARKING 60
BULBS —- MODUL BASE — HPS LU (CLR)
B5 70W (C70S62) 50
B6 100W (C100S54) 50
B7 150W (C150855) 50
B8 250W (C250S50) 50
B9 400W (C400S51) 12 |
B10 1000W (C1000S52) 12 |
BULBS - METAL HALIDE |
B11 175W (MH175/U) 50 |
B12 250W (MH 250/U) 12
B13 400W MH (H33) - MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12
Bl4 1000W (MH1000/U) 6
B15 1500W (MH1500/BU) — RECREATION 6
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL
B17 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100
B18 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS
ONLY)
T1 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12
T2 100W (C100S54) 6
T3 150W (C150855) 6
T4 250W (C250S50) 6
T5 400W (C400S510) 6
T6 1000W (C100S52) 6
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE,
T7 100W (MH100) — COURT PARKING —- MEDIUM | 12
T8 150W (MH150) — COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12
T9 175W (MH175/U) — MOGUL 6
T10 250W (MH 250/U) — MOGUL 6
T11 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT — MOGUL 6
T12 1000W (MH 1000/U) — MOGUL 6
T13 1500W (MH 1500/BU) —- MOBUL 6
PHOTO CELLS
PC1 PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105-
308 (BROWN OR GREY) L
PC2 TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET - 30862 | 24 N1
MULBERRY

Z:\BIDS.2014\14 BID.STREETLIGHTING.oex  COMPANY NAME ﬁtr\cp ?U“"-ﬂos , INL.
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# APPROXIMATE | COST
FIXTURES AND POLES
F1 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6 No Bl
F2 70W HPS LU M2AC07SIN2LMS21 24 ]
F3 150W HPS LU M2AC15SIN2LMS21 24 [
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12 |
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50
F6 ERS10AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12
F8 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12
F9 T10R07S1H2LMS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP | 12
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12
F11 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) 24
REFRACTORS & GLOBES N
Rl 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( 6
FP118-8) P49
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG 6
FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC) B132 28
R3 X&?GAI?E iN PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO | 12 NO BID
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 \
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE 50
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS
TS1 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12
TS2 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 12
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 12
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 12
TS6 12” DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
TS8 12” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
CABINET ACCESSORIES
Cl1 CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) 1
(CONTROLLER, PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR,
ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST OF ITEMS AND
PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER)
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDINSM | 1
3L)
c4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- | 1
82-06) \
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1 W

Z:BIDS 201414 BIDSTREET.LIGHTINGocx ~ COMPANY NAME 6@4&9 Rasw s, T
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LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS

L1 T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6 o Bl
COORDINATION UNIT

12 T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6 A

L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS | 6
COUNTDOWN, LED

14 T10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS | 6

L5 T12LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC | 6
SIGNAL SECTIONS

L6 T16 PDC 200 (4) —- LOAD SWITCHES 6

L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) — FLASHER 6
BOLLARDS

BL1 | BFI VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12
PARK)
OWK-3-8542-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB

BL2 | ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (15T ST 12
FLD)

BL3 | VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12
OWK1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK
MISCELLANEOUS

M1 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %”W X 60°(BLACK) | 6

M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60’ (RED) 6

M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60° (WHITE) 6

M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (BLUE) 6

M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (GREEN) 6

M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)

M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500’ 6
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) |

MS THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)

M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500° 6
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)

M10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315’ ROLLS 2

M1l | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3 M R/Y BULK 3
RED/YELLOW SPRING .

M12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING

(74
Z:BIDS 201414 BD.STREET.LIGETNG o~ COMPANY NAME FOD‘\QD | LPories , T
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET
COMPANY NAME:

COMPANY ADDRESS:

COMPANY TELEPHONE:

COMPANY FAX: )
COMPANY CONTACT: K Oée/ 7'/ 77/ \§ C/G/ e
TOTAL AMOUNT IN WORDS:

TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED

DATE: /1= /’/y’ -

SIGNED: JGC=rf «7/ M*M

PRINT NAME: s 0/9 /e

TITLE: L/ / res

Z:\BIDS.2014\14 BID.STREET LIGHTING.docx ~ COMPANY NAME 9




ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT ] )
" (APPROXIMATE) | COST | 7074
BULBS — MEDIUM BASE
Bl 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30
B2 100W MH (M90) - COURT PARKING 60
B3 150W HPS LU (C150868) 24
B4 150W MH (M102) — COURT PARKING 60
BULBS — MODUL BASE — HPS LU (CLR)
B5 70W (C70S62) 50
B6 100W (C100S54) 50
B7 150W (C150S55) 50
BS 250W (C250850) 50
B9 400W (C400851) 12
B10 | 1000W (C1000852) 12
BULBS - METAL HALIDE
Bll | 175W (MH175/U) 50
B12 [ 250W (MH 250/U) 12
B13 [ 400W MH (H33) - MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12
B14 | 1000W (MH1000/U) 6
BI5 | 1500W (MH1500/BU) - RECREATION 6
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL
B17 | 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100
BI8 | 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS
ONLY)
Tl 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12
T2 100W (C100S54) 6
T3 150W (C150S55) 6
T4 250W (C250850) 6
T5 400W (C4008510) 6
T6 1000W (C100852) 6
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE
7 100W (MH100) - COURT PARKING - MEDIUM | 12
T8 150W (MH150) — COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12
9 175W (MH175/U) - MOGUL 6
T10 | 250W (MH 250/U) — MOGUL 6
T11 | 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT - MOGUL 6
T12 | 1000W (MH 1000/U) ~ MOGUL 6
T13 | 1500W (MH 1500/BU) - MOBUL 6
PHOTO CELLS
PCI | PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300 of
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105- SY5 | j63S
308 (BROWN OR GREY) /
PC2 | TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET — 30862 | 24
MULBERRY

B,
ZABIDS.2014\14BID.STREETLIGHTING.docx ~ COMPANY NAME Relly e
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT Jule/
# APPROXIMATE | COST
FIXTURES AND POLES
F1 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6 140 (0] 1 o40. 00
F2 70W HPS LU M2AC07SIN2LMS21 24 162,79 3. 904.59
F3 150W HPS LU M2AC15SIN2LMS21 24 18/ 00| g vy do
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12 (4.c0| "ae5od
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50 c94.§0| 17 240.94U
F6 ERS10AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50 /1) 00| 1), dso.pu
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 J152.00 ;5 oy ¢l
F8 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 /1 ¢fo0| 1, 15680
F9 T10R07S1H2LMS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP | 12 ‘193900 1 9YE U
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 ) 2¥90U 19 IEF 00
F11 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 ;19808 9 17Cde
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) 24 ‘cegoo| ;Y 210
REFRACTORS & GLOBES ) g
R1 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( 6
FP118-8)
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG 6
FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC)
R3 VH65AB-3N-PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO | 12 -
FIXTURE)
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 5.5S L9LS Y
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 (.50 | vyc oo
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE 50 6.5C | 1vaco
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 . §0 | nymev
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS
TS1 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12
TS2 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 12
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 12
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 12
TS6 12” DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
TS8 12” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
CABINET ACCESSORIES
Cl CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) 1
(CONTROLLER, PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR,
ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST OF ITEMS AND
PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER)
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDINSM | 1
3L)
C4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- | 1
82-06)
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.STREET.LIGHTING.docx

COMPANY NAME
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Cp?f
LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS
L1 T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6
COORDINATION UNIT
) T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6
L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS | 6
COUNTDOWN, LED |
L4 TI10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS | 6
L5 T12LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC | 6
SIGNAL SECTIONS
16 T16 PDC 200 (4) — LOAD SWITCHES 6
L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) — FLASHER 6
BOLLARDS
BL1 | BFI VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12
PARK) Yo
OWK-3-8842-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB £79 | j9v98 90
BL2 | ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (15T ST 12 ol 7
FLD) ‘ 1G/0 /£ 11e.qo
BL3 | VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12 |
OWK 1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK J00S |1, plaob
MISCELLANEOUS
M1 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %"W X 60’(BLACK) | 6
M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60° (RED) 6
M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60° (WHITE) 6
M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60’ (BLUE) 6
M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60’ (GREEN) 6
M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500’ 6
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M8 THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500° 6
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315° ROLLS 2
M1l | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3 M R/Y BULK 3 .
RED/YELLOW SPRING 5000 | Seu
M12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING 300 | 76.00

ZA\BIDS.2014\14.BID.STREETLIGHTING.docx ~ COMPANY NAME
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TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET

COMPANY NAME:M%E&&:_@@LL&CW
M EDNae. ST

COMPANY ADDRESS: \.

~

ngx&lga_.& WLy \\Ge\
‘ \N

COMPANY TELEPHONE: - ENASS

COMPANY FAX: N1~ IR0
COMPANY CONTACT: Madds Qo
TOTAL AMOUNT IN WORDS:

TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED

DATE: \& Doz, \4

SIGNED: @%ﬂa&m&p&@%

PRINT NAME: oo X\ SaaxXo N

TITLE: (e S&%; / ( mD e
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

# (APPROXIMATE) COST
BULBS - MEDIUM BASE

Bl 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30 .24

B2 100W MH (M90) — COURT PARKING 60 2,93

B3 150W HPS LU (C150S68) 24 nEEY,

B4 150W MH (M102) —- COURT PARKING 60 .93
BULBS — MODUL BASE — HPS LU (CLR)

B5 70W (C70S62) 50 . 3y

B6 100W (C100S54) 50 1.y

B7 150W (C150855) 50 2,22

B3 250W (C250S50) 50 .88

B9 400W (C400S51) 12 7. 38

B10 1000W (C1000S52) 12 2737
BULBS - METAL HALIDE

Bl1 175W (MH175/U) 50 873

B12 250W (MH 250/U) 12 §.93

B13 400W MH (H33) — MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12 g.33

Bl4 1000W (MH1000/U) 6 2.4

B15 1500W (MH1500/BU) — RECREATION 6 rPOR R
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL

B17 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 Ay A tat—

B18 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 A (2 e
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS ONLY)

T1 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12 et 25

T2 100W (C100S54) 6 N =

T3 150W (C150855) 6 oe o

T4 250W (C250850) 6 s$9.25

T5 400W (C400S510) 6 6725

T6 1000W (C100S52) 6 /19.50
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE

T7 100W (MH100) — COURT PARKING — MEDIUM 12 S 58

T8 150W (MH150) — COURT PARKING — MEDIUM 12 &77.95

T9 175W (MH175/U) - MOGUL 6 S Atz

T10 250W (MH 250/U) — MOGUL 6 G¥- 77

T11 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT — MOGUL 6 7. Y

T12 1000W (MH 1000/U) - MOGUL 6 56 .32

T13 1500W (MH 1500/BU) — MOBUL 6 1O A=
PHOTO CELLS

PCl1 PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300 /o
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105- 6
308 (BROWN OR GREY)

PC2 TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET — 30862 | 24 7. 95
MULBERRY

Z:\BIDS.2014\14,BID.STREET.LIGHTING.docx . N 1
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# APPROXIMATE | COST
FIXTURES AND POLES
F1 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6 VY=
F2 70W HPS LU M2ACO07SIN2LMS21 24 157.1%
F3 150W HPS LU M2AC15SIN2LMS21 24 /75751
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12 &E. 75
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50 533.50
Fé6 ERST0AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50 A2 . SO
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 1223%.50
F8 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 (275, 28
F9 T10R07STH2L.MS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP 12 L) &bt
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 1223, 90
F11 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 i2/5. 3
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) 24 S592.5)
REFRACTORS & GLOBES
R1 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( FP118-8) | 6 )Y
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC) | 6 (1S5 =
R3 VH65AB-3N-PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO 12 b
FIXTURE) ( MO @ﬁb
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 7. 88
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 2.0
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE 50 2, 4O
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 30D
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS _
TS1 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12 W= @,r-ﬂ?:
TS2 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12 -
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 12
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 12
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 12
TS6 12 DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
TS8 12> ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
CABINET ACCESSORIES
Cl1 CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) (CONTROLLER, 1
PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR, ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST
OF ITEMS AND PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER)
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDI NSM 1
3L)
C4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- 1
82-06)
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1 ( //

Z)\BIDS.2014\14.BID. STREET. LIGHTING. docx .
COMPANYNAME i \A\ sg,,(ic: Eﬁg;tk g&; -§ g E QS?QE !)\.k )



LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS

Ll T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6 MO &)=
COORDINATION UNIT

L2 T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6

L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6
COUNTDOWN, LED

L4 T10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6

L5 T12LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC |6
SIGNAL SECTIONS

L6 T16 PDC 200 (4) — LOAD SWITCHES 6

L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) — FLASHER 6
BOLLARDS

BL1 BF1 VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12 g 7.5
PARK) ’
OWK-3-8542-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB

BL2 ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (1°T STFLD) | 12 Y. A7

BL3 VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12 '%;2 3 /
OWK1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK -

MISCELLANEQUS

Ml 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %W X 60°(BLACK) 6 -3/
M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %> X 60’ (RED) 6 A
M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (WHITE) 6 r 75
M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %4” X 60’ (BLUE) 6 - 25
M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (GREEN) 6 IS
M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500’ ROLL 6

(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) o @b‘k"
M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500° ROLL | 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M8 THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)
M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500’ ROLL | 6

(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) N

.

M10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315° ROLLS 2

MI1 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3 M R/Y BULK 3 32.75]
RED/YELLOW SPRING 2é s

MI12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3 oD
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING Z2.

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.STREET.LIGHTING.docx . N
COMPANYNAMEWW



TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET

COMPANY NAVE: Loms ShiPRsan Eleeti

COMPANY ADDRESS: ML Ao TMan AN 4—"
Protn N 1207

COMPANY TELEPHONE: - K YUl -Wp 0

COMPANY FAX: tﬂ% @05 ] [i\ﬂﬁg

COMPANY CONTACT: EAWd 6& AN

TOTAL AMOUNT INWORDS: __ || ? 15%.50

TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED

DATE: 1Lz \ “

SIGNED: _

PRINT NAME: / hlard @ \lﬁl\%

TITLE: Sale s f Kee—"
Louis Shiffman Electrie
542 Wortinan Ave.

Brooklyn, N.Y. 11208
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
4 (APPROXIMATE) | COST
BULBS — MEDIUM BASE
Bl 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30 Avd 73007
B2 100W MH (M90) — COURT PARKING 60 wAaC [ 470D
B3 150W HPS LU (C150S68) 24 400 M Jy JU
B4 150W MH (M102) — COURT PARKING 60 LA AI)
‘ BULBS — MODUL BASE — HPS LU (CLR) )
B5 70W (C70S62) 50 7 .00
B6 100W (C100S54) 50 10 U'fﬂ’f Y
B7 150W (C150S55) 50 480 VAo
BS 250W (C250S50) 50 1Y) ’\' 0, 00
B9 400W (C400S51) 12 ENEIVIIND
B10.___ | 1000W (C1000S52) 12 oLl 537,00
BULBS - METAL HALIDE
Bll | 175W (MHL75/U) 50 AEHBETRN
B12 | 250W (MH 250/U) 12 WASHEYE D)
B13 400W MH (H33) - MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12 IW.ENEND
Bl4 | 1000W (MH1000/U) 6 A VA
B15 | 1500W (MHI500/BU) — RECREATION 6 A0 WL Y
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL
B17 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 N2
BI8 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 NI
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS ~
ONLY) .
Tl 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12 5100 W, D
T2 100W (C100S54) 6 ROEEEETN
T3 150W (C150855) 6 W\u@ (ENN
T4 250W (C250850) 6 OLEY [5.ED
T5 400W (C400S510) 6 40 [
T6 1000W (C100S52) 6 (! \ﬂ) A VAT
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE )
T7 100W (MH100) - COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 AN EEED
T8 150W (MH150) - COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 vy (Y9000
T9 175W (MH175/U0) — MOGUL 6 %000 714100
T10 250W (MH 250/U) - MOGUL 6 MUY YD 0D
T11 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT - MOGUL 6 IO
T12 | 1000W (MH 1000/U) — MOGUL 6 LHEWEE AN
T13 1500W (MH 1500/BU) — MOBUL 6 W20 [N o
PHOTO CELLS )
PCl | PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105- | %52\ (\Du 1 eIV
308 (BROWN OR GREY) QuoTiAG Tork &% + OWUUM/D Nn D
PC2 | TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET — 30862 ‘
MULBERRY /‘ a”l( M 0.0
Z:\BIDS.2014\14BID STREET.LIGHTING.ocx ~ COMPANY NAME 10
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# APPROXIMATE | COST.
FIXTURES AND POLES NO Bl
F1 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6
F2 70W HPS LU M2ACO07SIN2LMS21 24
F3 150W HPS LU M2ACI15SIN2LMS21 24
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50
F6 ERS10AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12
F8 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12
F9 T10R07SIH2LMS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP | 12
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12
F11 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) 24
REFRACTORS & GLOBES
R1 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( 6 \
FP118-8)
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG 6
FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC)
R3 VH65AB-3N-PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO | 12 ) 1
FIXTURE)
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS A
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 WO AL TY
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 R PZERN)
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE 50 N OELZERY
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 AU RZEE
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS TR
TSI 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12 ]
TS2 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 12
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 12
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 12
TS6 12” DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
TS8 12” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12
CABINET ACCESSORIES
Cl CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) 1
(CONTROLLER, PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR,
ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST OF ITEMS AND
PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER)
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDINSM__ | 1
3L)
C4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- | 1
82-06)
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1 )
prd
Z)\BIDS.2014\14BID STREET LIGHTING.doex  COMPANY NAME 11
' Louis Shiffman Eleciric
542 Wortman Ave.

Bronklvn, N.Y 11208




ZABIDS.2014\14BID STREET LIGHTING.doex ~ COMPANY NAME

Brookyn, N.Y. 11208

n —)
LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS DR Z N
L1 T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6 M
COORDINATION UNIT
L2 T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6
L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6
COUNTDOWN, LED
L4 T10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6
L5 TI2LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC | 6
SIGNAL SECTIONS
L6 T16 PDC 200 (4) — LOAD SWITCHES 6
L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) - FLASHER 6
BOLLARDS
BLI BF1 VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12
PARK)
OWK-3-8542-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB
BL2 ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (15T ST 12
FLD)
BL3 VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12 P
OWK 1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK _~
MISCELLANEOUS - .
M1 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %”W X 60’(BLACK) 6 N A1)
M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (RED) 6 Ml 0
M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (WHITE) 6 Ll 2.0
M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %~ X 60’ (BLUE) 6 L0 L0
M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (GREEN) 6 Qo) B
M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500’ ROLL 6 PSP
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) W : e
M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500’ 6 Ny 70
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) ﬂ : TlU M
M8 THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500’ ROLL 6 ™20 | Z2h ¢0
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) ﬂ) F ﬂﬂ) :
M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500° 6 (2 |7 0 7N
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) - \20 . 90 -
MI10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315’ ROLLS 2 MEUEER
M1l | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3 M R/’Y BULK 3 s ‘ S‘
RED/YELLOW SPRING 0y DAY
MI12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3 z ‘s ;M' (m
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING ) o\
Louis Shiffmar Electrie
542 Wortman Ave.
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5200 SERIES

UTILITY GRADE ELECTRONIC
WITH FAIL ON MODE
PHOTOCONTROL

‘ FEATURES
STANDARDS: Meets ANSI (136.10

including color designations. Also meets EEI

NEMA standards.

HOUSING: UV stabilized, ANSI color-
toded, high impact polypropylene dome.
Cross-linked polypropylene gasket. High
impact ABS base. High impact, UV stabilized
acrylic window.

ENERGY SAVINGS: Works with screw
base CFLs and LED lamps.

5231 78885 105-130vAC

78886

CONTACT RATINGS

105-305VAC

SPECIFICATIONS -

ON/OFF: Turn ONis 1.5 foot candle +/- 0.2 OFF/ON
ratio is 1.5:1 average*.

TIME DELAY: Instant ON/3-5 second OFF*.

CELL: Silican photosensor ussures drift-free operation,
turning on and off at the sume light level consistently
throughout the life of the unit.

CONTACTS: DC relay has positive snap action switching,
reducing bounce and prolonging contact life. Fail ON for

safety.

SURGE ARRESTOR: 920 joule MOV (metal oxide
varistor) exceeds ANS| and NEMA requirements.

LOCKING PRONGS: Solid brass for maximum cerrosion
resistance and elecirical conducivity.

POWER CONSUMPTION: 1.0 watt average @ 120V,

TEMPERATURE RANGE:
-40" to +158°F (-40° 1o +70°C).

FAIL MODE: ON.
WARRANTY: 5 years.

*Consul fuctory for other ratios and fime delays.

| RATING
TUNGSTEN BALLAST

Silicon Photosensor 1000w 1800VA

- LIGHT SENSOR

Silicon Photosensor 1000W 1800VA

WIRING DIAGRAMS

105 10 285 volt
single phase grounded
supplies and loads




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET

COMPANY NamE: [ ra e 5;16&3:'/)’16, Inc .
COMPANY ADDRESS: 224 N. Fohr Wa\/
'Ea\\! 5‘0()@}, NY 1170V

COMPANY TELEPHONE: L3)-242 - 4297
COMPANY FAX: 31 -242- 4296
COMPANY CONTACT: Moy H&f 146)
P ' -
TOTAL AMOUNT IN WORDS: Wity Seven Hyisaind. Fay hYdfe({ FO”&‘/ Fhred

¥ Zero cont
TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED 1

DATE: A ;’,&Y‘F
7/

SIGNED: ¢
PRINT NAME- RlCL‘})CW d L’{ ArsSani CO
TITLE: 7 = CLQW("
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT

# (APPROXIMATE) | COST
BULBS —- MEDIUM BASE

B1 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30

B2 100W MH (M90) —- COURT PARKING 60

B3 150W HPS LU (C150S68) 24 /

B4 150W MH (M102) — COURT PARKING 60 /
BULBS — MODUL BASE — HPS LU (CLR)

B5 70W (C70S62) 50

B6 100W (C100S54) 50

B7 150W (C150855) 50

BS 250W (C250850) 50

B9 400W (C400S51) 12

B10 1000W (C1000S52) 12
BULBS - METAL HALIDE

Bl 175W (MH175/U) 50

B12 250W (MH 250/U) 12

B13 400W MH (H33) - MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12

B14 1000W (MH1000/U) 6

B15 1500W (MH1500/BU) — RECREATION 6
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL N

B17 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 N

B18 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 ) / |
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS d /
ONLY)

Tl 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12 , /

T2 100W (C100S54) 6 W\ /

T3 150W (C150855) 6 W\ /

T4 250W (C250S50) 6 \N /

T5 400W (C400S510) 6 Ji

T6 1000W (C100S52) 6 /
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE /

T7 100W (MH100) — COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 /

T8 150W (MH150) - COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 /

T9 175W (MH175/U) - MOGUL 6 /

T10 250W (MH 250/U) — MOGUL 6 /

T11 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT — MOGUL 6 /

T12 1000W (MH 1000/U) — MOGUL 6 /

T13 1500W (MH 1500/BU) - MOBUL 6 /
PHOTO CELLS /

PCl1 PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105- /
308 (BROWN OR GREY) |

PC2 TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET — 30862 | 24
MULBERRY

Z:\BIDS.2014\14.BID.STREET.LIGHTING.docx

COMPANY NAME

Traffic Systems;, inc:
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# APPROXIMATE | COST /
FIXTURES AND POLES /
F1 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6 /
F2 70W HPS LU M2AC07SIN2LMS21 24 /
F3 150W HPS LU M2AC15SIN2LMS21 24 /
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12 /
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50 /
F6 ERS10AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50 /
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 /
F8 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 /
F9 T10R07SIH2LMS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP | 12 \ /
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 NN Y /
F11 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 X\ /
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) 24 Vi /
REFRACTORS & GLOBES N /
R1 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( 6 \ /
FP118-8) \( )
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG 6 & /
FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC)
R3 VH65AB-3N-PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO | 12 /
FIXTURE)
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS /
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 /
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 /
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE 50 /
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 /
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS R
TS1 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12— 44 . 558 &0
TS2 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12 P 50.2° | Lo .00
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 127,41 D0 S° NS0 |, 0. 00
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 107"/ 4 44 .00 | 50020 |5 98 .00
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 1 \ =D .22 7.00).CO
TS6 12” DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12 50-°C | ,HA .00
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12 NB —
TS8 12” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12 7509 (900 .¢°
CABINET ACCESSORIES
Cl CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) ¥ 1
(CONTROLLER, PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR,
ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST OF ITEMS AND 8,535 L 8 535|0¢
PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER) .
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1 X475 2 475|°
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDINSM | 1 C® " a0
3L) 330 33~
C4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- | 1 |
82-06) 390%| 390X
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1 4230 | 435



LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS

L1 T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6 &
COORDINATION UNIT 11505 LGDDM

L2 T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6 GO | 540 .0

L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6
COUNTDOWN, LED 234 0P| | 4p4.%0

L4 T10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS 6 2002 [ 126D

L5 T12LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC | 6
SIGNAL SECTIONS 10725 Lbi2.ce

L6 T16 PDC 200 (4) — LOAD SWITCHES 6 (7250 | ievs . cO

L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) — FLASHER 6 [R.00 | [0 o<
BOLLARDS

BLI1 BF1 VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12
PARK)

OWK-3-8842-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB ﬁ /

BL2 ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (15T ST 12 v
FLD) \

BL3 VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12 \ _ &
OWK1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK N X
MISCELLANEOUS \ ZA

M1 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %”W X 60’(BLACK) 6 \ ~\

M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (RED) 6 N

M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %> X 60’ (WHITE) 6

M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (BLUE) 6 \

M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60’ (GREEN) 6 \

M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6 ‘

(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) \

M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500° 6 \
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)

M8 THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500’ ROLL 6 \
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN)

M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500’ 6 \
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) \

M10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315’ ROLLS 2 \

Mi1 WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG - 3 M R/Y BULK 3 \
RED/YELLOW SPRING

M12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3 N\
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING
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;l Traffic Systems, Inc.

Page 1 of 1

Re: T/O Riverhead
TOTAL
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY | UNIT PRICE PRICE
NEMA CABINET, 8 PHASE, 12 POSITION, TO INCLUDE EA. 1 $8,535.00 $8,535.00
]
NEMA CABINET, 4 PHASE, 8 POSITION, TO INCLUDE EA. 1 $7,080.00 $7,080.00

Confidential

12/16/2014

Page 1



DESCRIPTION

QTY

NEMA 4 PHASE CABINET WITH 8P6 PANEL, TYPE G

INTELIGHT X1 TS2 TYPE 2 CONTROLLER WITH MAX TIME SOFTWARE

NSM-6E 6 CHANNEL MONITOR

LOAD SWITCH

FLASHER

FLASH TRANSFER RELAY

W |= |||




DESCRIPTION

QTY

NEMA 8 PHASE CABINET WITH 12P12 PANEL, TYPE M

INTELIGHT X1 TS2 TYPE 2 CONTROLLER WITH MAX TIME SOFTWARE

NSM-12E 12 CHANNEL MONITOR

LOAD SWITCH

FLASHER

FLASH TRANSFER RELAY

O)_A.m._\—\_\




TOWN OF RIVERHEAD
STREET LIGHT AND TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE REPAIR PARTS

PRICE SHEET

company Nave:_ WESCo s 7L l///7)1/@m
COMPANY ADDRESS: 5000 /oy e Ploce

%7@@&9.&0,@ /\/9/ /288

COMPANY TELEPHONE: 67/- A9 7-58£ 9
COMPANY FAX: 03/~ 345~ /336
COMPANY CONTACT: (fomr sco fBMaceso
TOTAL AMOUNT IN WORDS:

TOTAL BID: SEE ATTACHED

DATE: )

SIGNED: i 9\5&

PRINT NAME: (C/\T 058 Lnge| e
TITLE:

ZA\BIDS.2014\14 BID.STREET.LIGHTING.doox ~ COMPANY NAME W EZS & '<9 ‘37/' {/ Vs 32 o)



ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
# (APPROXIMATE) | COST
BULBS — MEDIUM BASE
Bl 50W HPS LU (C50S68) 30 ?./5
B2 100W MH (M90) — COURT PARKING 60 )7 35
B3 150W HPS LU (C150S68) 24 9.5
B4 150W MH (M102) — COURT PARKING 60 /7.35
BULBS — MODUL BASE — HPS LU (CLR)
B5 70W (C70S62) 50 P75
B6 100W (C100S54) 50 @15
B7 150W (C150S55) 50 P[5
B8 250W (C250850) 50 7. 15
B9 400W (C400S51) 12 Q. /5
B10 1000W (C1000S52) 12 F0 - 40
BULBS - METAL HALIDE
Bl1 175W (MH175/U) 50 /] 5
BI12 250W (MH 250/U) 12 /3 .50
B13 400W MH (H33) - MUNICIPAL GARAGE 12 Ve )
Bl4 1000W (MH1000/U) 6 )
B15 1500W (MH1500/BU) — RECREATION 6 Jo. 95
BULBS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL
B17 69W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 . 79
BI8 116W A21/TS SHORT STEM (120V) 100 s 40
TRANSFORMERS (ADVANCE MODELS
ONLY)
T1 70W ADVANCE 71A7971001D 12 Fb- 30
T2 100W (C100S54) 6 93 . 35
T3 150W (C150855) 6 FZ:00
T4 250W (C250S50) 6 53,50
TS 400W (C4008510) 6 6352
T6 1000W (C100S52) 6 /1545
TRANSFORMERS - METAL HALIDE
T7 100W (MH100) - COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 3450
T8 150W (MH150) - COURT PARKING — MEDIUM | 12 I8.75
T9 175W (MH175/U) — MOGUL 6 S/ b0
T10 250W (MH 250/U) — MOGUL 6 3 465
Ti11 400W (MH 400/U) MULTI VOLT — MOGUL 6 8050
T12 1000W (MH 1000/U) - MOGUL 6 8375
T13 1500W (MH 1500/BU) — MOBUL 6 EE 65
PHOTO CELLS
PC1 PHOTO CELLS 6390 MULTI VOLT 300
120/208/240/277 TWIST LOCK VOLT RANGE 105- PE
308 (BROWN OR GREY) /7
PC2 TWIST LOCK REPLACEMENT SOCKET — 30862 | 24 , 50
MULBERRY 4

N - /
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ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT
4 APPROXIMATE | COST
FIXTURES AND POLES
Fl 20’ TEST POLE HIGHLINE (HL-100) BLACK 6 discartrwedl 70 P d
F2 70W HPS LU M2ACO07SIN2LMS21 24 /6750
F3 150W HPS LU M2AC15SIN2LMS21 24 /B8, 00
F4 35-962470-04 FLAT LENS GLASS 12 4700
F5 ERS20DXBX5405GRAY LED 82W 50 574 ®
F6 ERS10AXBX540GRAY LED 42W 50 443 ¢°
F7 EPAS-0-B5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 /370 e
F38 EPAS-0-D5-A-41-B-2-F-BLCK-FT 12 /78 <
F9 T10R07SIH2LMS3BL EVOLVE LED POST TOP | 12 35 °°
F10 EPAS-4-B5-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 /3577
F11 EPAS-4-DR-A-41-B2-F-BLCK (AVERY) LED 12 /3077
F12 EPST-0-D3-41-N-5 (TOWN & CTRY) 24 634 °°
REFRACTORS & GLOBES
R1 850 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG FIXTURE)( | 6 o
FP118-8) 492%
R2 840 GLOBE LEXAN (STERNBERG 6 e
FIXTURE)(FP192-8PCC) g 96~
R3 VH65AB-3N-PE REFRACTOR LEXAN (HADCO | 12 o0 by of
FIXTURE)
FUSE & FUSE HOLDERS
F1 HEB-AA FUSE HOLDER 50 2,35
F2 KTK 15 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 5-35
F3 KTK 20 AMP 600 V MIDGET FUSE 50 5-40
F4 KTK 30 AMP 600V MIDGET FUSE 50 5. 40
TRAFFIC SIGNAL LED LENS .
TS1 8” DR4 GTFB-17A LED LENS (GREEN) 12 no hd
TS2 | 8” DR4 YTFB-17A LED LENS (YELLOW) 12 o bid
TS3 8” DR4 RTFB-17A LED LENS (RED) 12 e Hid,
TS4 12” DR6 GCFB-17A (GREEN) 12 o bid.
TS5 12” DR6 YCFB-17A (YELLOW) 12 no bid
TS6 12” DR6 RCFB-17A (RED) 12 no bid
TS7 8” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12 o bicl
TS8 12” ARROW (GREEN/AMBER) 12 no Hicd
CABINET ACCESSORIES
Cl CABINET ACCESSORIES (NEMA) 1
(CONTROLLER, PDC, CONFLICT MONITOR,
ETC. PLEASE PROVDE LIST OF ITEMS AND k
PRICES FOR EACH MANUFACTURER) e bid
C2 CONTROLLER (ECONOLITE) 1 e bid
C3 CONFLICT MONITOR (3 CHANNEL) (EDINSM | 1
3L) no bid
c4 CONFLICT MONITOR (6 CHANNEL) (PDC CM- | 1 .
82-06) o bid
C5 CONFLICT MONITOR (12 CHANNEL) 1 o Hd

J
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LED TRAFFIC SIGNALS
L1 T7SS ENCOM SPREAD SPECTRUM 6 :
COORDINATION UNIT o bid
12 T7SS ATENEX YAGI ANTENNA 6 o bick
L3 T10CB GEL CORE (2) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS | 6 .
COUNTDOWN, LED no bd
L4 T10LA GEL CORE (4) PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS | 6 o bid
L5 T12LED GEL CORE (36)-12” BALL LED TRAFFIC | 6 -
SIGNAL SECTIONS o Hidl
L6 T16 PDC 200 (4) — LOAD SWITCHES 6 o bid
L7 T16 PDC 204 (1) — FLASHER 6 o brd
BOLLARDS
BL1 | BFI VISIONAIRE LGT BRONZE (STOTZKY 12
PARK) 905
OWK-3-8842-COG-60L-LED-55KL-UNV-AB-VRB
BL2 ELE2-3-T3-144LC-5-4K-UNV-KM-BZ (13T ST 12 o0
FLD) /[5G0
BL3 | VISIONAIRE OCEAN WALK ROUND LED 12 o
OWK1-8R42-SLR-20LLS-7-55K-UNV-AB-BK JO55
MISCELLANEOUS
M1 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %”W X 60°(BLACK) | 6 s 70
M2 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60° (RED) 6 . 76
M3 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %” X 60° (WHITE) 6 . 76
M4 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60° (BLUE) 6 . 76
M5 3M 1700 ELECTRIC TAPE %" X 60° (GREEN) 6 . /b
M6 THHWN WIRE SOLID 10 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6 oo
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) ok
M7 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 10 GAUGE 500’ 6 ]
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) g4 ¢
M8 THHWN WIRE SOLID 12 GAUGE 500° ROLL 6 L0
(WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) 53
M9 THHWN WIRE STRANDED 12 GAUGE 500° 6 0
ROLL (WHITE, BLACK, GREEN) 63
MI10 | #6 BARE COPPER WIRE 315’ ROLLS 2 /35 7
M1l | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3 M R/Y BULK 3 o
RED/YELLOW SPRING il
MI12 | WIRE NUTS 500 PER BAG — 3M O/B BULK 3
Q2 5-0
ORANGE/BLUE SPRING =Y
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