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07.03.2018  ADOPTED 
180526 

 
 

TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
 

Resolution # 526  
 

AWARDS BID FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES  
 
 

Councilwoman Kent  offered the following resolution, 
 

which was seconded by  Councilman Hubbard 
 

WHEREAS, the Town Clerk was authorized to publish and post a notice for 
sealed bids for JANITORIAL SUPPLIES for the Town of Riverhead and; 

 
WHEREAS, 11 bids were received, opened and read aloud in the Office of the 

Town Clerk, 200 Howell Avenue, Riverhead, NY 11901 on MAY 22nd, 2018 at 2:00 pm; 
and  

WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of the Purchasing Department that the bid 
for JANITORIAL SUPPLIES be and hereby is, awarded to ALL AMERICAN POLY; 
APCO PAPER & PLASTICS CORP.; BAR BOY RODUCTS; CENTRAL POLY 
CORP.;CONSERV FLAG COMPANY; GRIFFING HARDWARE CO., INC.; IMPERIAL 
DADE PAPER COMPANY; INTERBORO PACKAGING; and MASTERMANS LLP for 
prices on the attached pages; and 

 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Town Clerk be and is hereby 

authorized to forward a copy of this resolution to ALL AMERICAN POLY; APCO 
PAPER & PLASTICS CORP.; BAR BOY RODUCTS; CENTRAL POLY CORP.; 
CONSERV FLAG COMPANY; GRIFFING HARDWARE CO., INC.; IMPERIAL DADE 
PAPER COMPANY; INTERBORO PACKAGING; and MASTERMANS LLP, and  the 
Purchasing Department; and   
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, all Town Hall Departments may review and obtain 
a copy of this resolution from the electronic storage device and if needed, a certified 
copy of same may be obtained from the Office of the Town Clerk. 

 
THE VOTE 

 
Kent Yes No       Hubbard Yes No 

    Giglio Yes No  Wooten Yes No 
Jens-Smith Yes No 

The Resolution Was  Was Not  
Thereupon Duly Declared Adopted 
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FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT 
OF PROPOSED RIVERHEAD TOWN BOARD LEGISLATION 

 
A. Type of Legislation 
 
Resolution         x                      Local Law                .                                                                                                                                                                          

B. Title of Proposed Legislation: 
RESOLUTION FOR APPROVAL OF JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR USE BY THE 
TOWN OF RIVERHEAD 
C. Purpose of Proposed Legislation: 

D. Will the Proposed Legislation Have a Fiscal Impact?         Yes                    No __X__          
 
 
 E. If the answer to section D is "yes", select (a) or (b) below and initial or detail as 
applicable: 
  
(a) the fiscal impact can be absorbed by Town/ department existing resources set forth in 
approved Town Annual Budget             (example: routine and budgeted procurement of 
goods/services) *if selecting E(a), please initial then skip items F, G, and complete H, I, 
and J;  
                                                                  or  
(b) the description/explanation of fiscal impact is set forth as follows: 
 
 F. If the answer to E required description/explanation of fiscal impact (E(b)), please 
describe total Financial Cost of Funding over 5 Years 

G. Proposed Source of Funding 
Appropriation Account to be Charged: 
 
 
Grant or other Revenue Source: 
 
 
Appropriation Transfer (list account(s) and amount): 

 H. Typed Name & Title of 
Preparer  M. TAGUE 

I. Signature of Preparer 
    Mary Ann Tague                                                     
 

J. Date 
6.20.18 

K. Accounting Staff Name & Title 
William Rothaar, Financial 
Administrator 
 

L. Signature of Accounting Staff 
William Rothaar 
 

M. Date 
6/26/18 
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DESCRIPTION                                                                              

UNIT

ALL 
AMERICAN 

POLY APPCO BAR BOY
CENTRAL 

POLY
CONSERV 
FLAG CO. GRIFFING

IMPERIAL 
DADE INTERBOROMASTERMANS SCHRIER UNIPAK

DESCRIPTION                                                                              PACKAGE NO BID  

1 ALUMINUM FOIL ROLL 18" X 500' .001 ROLL NO BID 14.49 28.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.90 NO BID 30.31 19.99 NO BID

2 3 COMPT ALUMINUM PANS W/ LIDS -250/CASE 250/CASE NO BID 39.97 69.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 89.90 NO BID NO BID 33.98 NO BID

3 AMMONIA, QTS - 12/CASE 12/CASE NO BID 9.79 11.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.45 NO BID 27.56 NO BID NO BID

4 2PE3V HVY WHITE POLY APRON 24" X 46" -500/CASE 500/CASE NO BID 3.79 61.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.98 32..00/1000 52.82 /1000 NO BID NO BID

5 BAG TIES, 4” GREEN/TWISTY/2000 CS. 2000/BOX NO BID 2.19 2.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.39 NO BID 13.11 NO BID NO BID

6 BAGS, GARBAGE, 33" X 39" 16 micron Hi-Density -
250/CASE (no Nominal Weight) 250/CASE 23.58 NO BID 21.50 14.10 18.89 NO BID 15.09 16.34 41.05 /200 NO BID 12.10

7 BAGS, KRAFT GROCERY #6 - 2000 / BUNDLE 500/CASE NO BID 9.63 12.60 NO BID 14.89 NO BID 10.87 NO BID 23.42 NO BID NO BID

8 BAGS, PLASTIC , FOOD GRADE, 1.4MIL -  500/CASE 500/CASE NO BID 12.67 NO BID NO BID 45.89-1000/CS NO BID 42.61 19.24 NO BID NO BID 19.50

9 BAGS, WAXED SANDWICH - 6000/CASE 6000/CASE NO BID 11.07 85.00 NO BID 31.89-2000/CS NO BID 12.79-1000/cs NO BID 122.78 62.64 NO BID 

10 BLEACH, 5.25%, GALLONS - 6/CASE
6/CASE NO BID 9.29 15.90 NO BID NO BID 11.10 12.10 NO BID NO BID 12.5 /12 NO BID 

11 32OZ SPRAY BOTTLES W/ HI VOLUME SPRAYER EACH NO BID 0.49 1.59 NO BID NO BID 15.48-12/CS 0.43 NO BID 9.17 NO BID NO BID 

12 BOWL, 12OZ CHINET,  HD PLASTIC - 1000/CASE 1000/CASE NO BID 18.79 41.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 41.22 NO BID 89.75 NO BID NO BID 

13 BOWL,   5OZ CHINET,  HD PLASTIC - 1000/CASE 1000/CASE NO BID 18.79 34.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.92 NO BID 40.92 NO BID NO BID 

14 BROOM, CORN, HD JANITOR EACH NO BID 4.93 5.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.88 NO BID 14.62 6.15 NO BID 

15 BROOM, 18" PUSH,MED BRISTLE,NO HANDLE EACH NO BID 10.79 12.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.89 NO BID 16.74 NO BID NO BID 

16 BRUSH, TOILET BOWL EACH NO BID 6.72 2.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.22 NO BID 10.44 NO BID NO BID 

17 BRUSH,HD FLOOR,PLASTIC BODY W/HANDLE EACH NO BID 12.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

18 CARDBOARD LUNCH BOX 9"X 5"X 4" - 250/BUNDLE 250/BNDLE NO BID 44.93 42.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

19 HAND SANITIZER 4/CS NO BID 58.67-6 109 4-2LT NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.36 NO BID 43.38 /6 1 LITER NO BID NO BID 

20 DISPENSERS FOR HAND SANITIZER EACH NO BID 12.79 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO     CHARGENO BID 8.92 NO BID NO BID 
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21 HAND SOAP-1 GAL 4/CASE NO BID 14.63 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 19.87 NO BID 42.68 /12 160 NO BID NO BID 

22 CLEANSER,  POWDER 24/CS NO BID 16.29 26.20 NO BID NO BID 28.00 19.42 NO BID 36.46 NO BID NO BID 

23 CUPS, COLD 3OZ PAPER - 2500/CASE 2400/CASE NO BID 48.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 52.48 NO BID 210.85 /5M NO BID NO BID 

24 CUPS, DART 6OZ FOAM 1000/CS 1000/CASE NO BID 19.63 22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 22.16 NO BID 39.23 NO BID NO BID 

25 CUPS,  8OZ FOAM 1000/CS 1000/CASE NO BID 20.79 25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.93 NO BID 43.13 20.84 NO BID 

26 CUPS, 10 OZ.FOAM/1000/CS 1000/CS NO BID 26.93 69.00-2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.90 NO BID 51.68 26.54 NO BID 

27 CUPS, DART 5OZ SOFT PLASTIC  2500/CS 2500/CS NO BID 29.67 37.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID 43.90 NO BID 56.92 26.95 NO BID 

28 CUTLERY KITS, IND. WRAPPED/1000/CS 1000/CS NO BID 8.98 15.2-250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.98 NO BID 23.35 /250 NO BID NO BID 

29 DEODORANT, BOWL BLOCK W/ WIRE 3.5OZ DOZEN NO BID 15.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

30 DUST MOP REFILL, 36" X 5" - 12/CASE 12/CASE NO BID NO BID 12.50-EA NO BID NO BID 111.00 49.88 NO BID 108.72 NO BID NO BID 

31 FORKS, HD PLASTIC - 1000/CASE 1000/CASE NO BID 12.97 22.50 8.00 NO BID NO BID 17.92 NO BID 18.05 12.95 NO BID 

32 GLOVES. 8OZ BROWN JERSEY - 12 PAIR                                                                                 12/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.49 9.00 7.64 NO BID 13.51 NO BID NO BID 

33 GLOVES, LEATHER PALM W/ GAUNTLET - 12 PAIR                                                                         12/PAIR/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 34.68 28.50 NO BID NO BID 32.71 NO BID NO BID 

34 GLOVES, RED LINED JERSEY - 12 PAIR                                                                                 DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.89 19.80 NO BID NO BID 20.55 NO BID NO BID 

35 GLOVES, BROWN JERSEY 8 OZ. PAIR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.75 NO BID NO BID 8.48 NO BID NO BID 

36 GLOVES, LEATHER PALM W/GAUNTLET DOZEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28.50 NO BID NO BID 32.71 NO BID NO BID 

37 GLOVES, RED LINED JERSEY PAIR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.65 NO BID NO BID 9.05 NO BID NO BID 

38 GLOVES, NITRILE,5 1/2 ML THICK (MUST BE THIS MIL) 1000/CS NO BID 39.09 42.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 36.00 73.81 NO BID 28.50

39 GLOVES, LATEX, YELLOW ASST. SIZES DOZEN NO BID 4.79 10.80 NO BID 5.89 NO BID 5.47 NO BID 13.46 NO BID NO BID

40 GLOVES, POLY, FOOD GRADE DISPOSABLE 1000/CASE NO BID 4.79 5.50 NO BID 5.89 NO BID 63.8/10M NO BID 13.86 NO BID NO BID
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41 HANDIWIPES, CLOTHS                                                                             CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

42 HAND CLEANER,HEAVY DUTY, STOKO CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 69.07 /2LTR-4 NO BID NO BID

43 STOKO HAND CLEANER DISPENSER CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.07 NO BID NO BID

44 KNIVES, HD PLASTIC                                                                                  1000/CS NO BID 12.97 22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.92 NO BID 18.05 12.95 NO BID

45 LIDS, BOARD/CASE FOR 3 COMPT ALUM PANS -
 500/CASE                                                                 500/CS NO BID 11..69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

46 LIDS,FOR 6 OZ. CUPS 1000/CS NO BID 10.67 15.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.38 NO BID 26.95 13.17 NO BID

47 LIDS, PLASTIC, VENTED  (TOFIT 8 OZ. CUPS)                                                                   1000/CS NO BID 11.97 15.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.38 NO BID 26.95 13.17 NO BID

48 LIDS, PLASTIC, VENTED TO FIT 8 OZ. CUPS                                                                         1000/CS NO BID 12.49 18.90 NO BID NN NO BID 16.77 NO BID 27.36 13.48 NO BID

49 LINERS, 30"X 36", 16 MICRON, HI DENSITY, NATURAL – 
500/CASE -NO NOMINAL WGHT. 250/CASE 19.78-100/CS NO BID NO BID 12.10 31.89-500/CS NO BID 18.08 20.82 /500 39.85 NO BID 18.00/ 500

50 LINERS, 38"X60" 22 MICRON, HI DENSITY, BLACK (NO 
NOMINAL WEIGHT)100/CS 100/CASE 15.78 NO BID NO BID 17.50 24.89-150/CS NO BID 22.08 20.24 /150 58.33 /200 NO BID 15.00

51 LINERS, 40"X 48" 16 Micron Hi density Liners 250/CASE (No 
Nominal WEIGHT) 250/CASE 13.29- 100/CS NO BID NO BID 26.00 25.89 NO BID 23.62 19.82 /250 50.79 28.50 16.70

52 LINERS, 24"X 23" 6 MICRON, HI DENSITY, NATURAL-1000   1000/CASE 18.20- 500/CS NO BID NO BID 14.00 14.89 NO BID 10.55 13.82 /1000 29.17 NO BID 9.50

53 LINERS, 24"X 33" 8 MICRON, HI DENSITY, NATURAL-
1000-CASE-NO NOMINAL WEIGHT 1000/CASE 26.12- 500/CS NO BID NO BID 18.00 26.89 NO BID 19.98 20.82 46.21 24.59 14.00

54 LINERS,GARBAGE,42" X 57" 2 MIL,IND.FOLDER,FLAT 
BOTTOM/100 CS 100/CASE 18.65 NO BID NO BID 26.00 NO BID NO BID 19.87 26.82 NO BID NO BID 18.00

55 LIQUID, POT & PAN DETERGENT                                                           4/GAL/CS NO BID 13.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.79 NO BID 38.76 NO BID NO BID

56 MURIATIC ACID, HD GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

57 MOP BUCKET W/ WHEELS,                                                                       44 QT. NO BID 39.89 51.00-35 QT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 219.92 NO BID NO BID

58 MOP HANDLE, SCREW TYPE EACH NO BID NO BID 7.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.60 NO BID 13.75 NO BID NO BID

59 MOP HEAD, 24 OZ, 8PLY - WIDE BAND                                                                                 EACH NO BID NO BID 2.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.10 NO BID 14.69 NO BID NO BID

60 MOP HEAD, MED BLEND, LOOPED, WIDE BAND                                                                   EACH NO BID NO BID 79.90-20/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.10 NO BID 16.40 NO BID NO BID
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61 MOP HEAD, 32OZ, 8PLY - WIDE BAND                                                                  EACH NO BID NO BID 2.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.79 NO BID 16.40 NO BID NO BID

62 MOPS, YACHT, 12OZ                                                                             EACH NO BID NO BID 4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

63 NAPKINS, LUNCH           1 PLY, 13X13                                                          6000/CS NO BID 22.69 29.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.22 NO BID 42.50 21.92-20.84 NO BID

64 PADS, BRILLO (OR EQUAL)                                                                               60 PADS NO BID 24.83 31.00 12/10'S NO BID NO BID 24.00 28.77-120 NO BID 46.11 /120 NO BID NO BID

65 PADS, STEEL WOOL  - 6 PK                                                                                     16 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.60 22.20-72 NO BID 46.11 /12 NO BID NO BID

66 PADS, 3M FLOOR, 20" BLACK STRIPPING - 5/CASE                                                                      5/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 63.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.20 NO BID NO BID

67 PADS, 3M FLOOR, 20" RED BUFFING - 5/CASE                                                                          5/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 33.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.20 NO BID NO BID

69 PADS, 3M FLOOR, 17" BLACK STRIPPING 5/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 49.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.27 NO BID NO BID

70 PLACEMATS, EMBOSSED, WHITE 1000/CS NO BID 9.69 25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.98 NO BID 32.60 NO BID NO BID

71 PLATES, WHITE CLAY COATED SPIRAL                                                               1000/CS NO BID 12.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

72 PLATES, 10.25" CHINET COMPARTMENT HD PLASTIC 500/CS NO BID 58.79 56.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 64.60 NO BID 51.85 NO BID NO BID

73 PLATES, 9" CHINET HD PLASTIC                                                                       500/CS NO BID 30.79 39.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.71 NO BID 30.69 NO BID NO BID

74 PLATES, 6" CHINET HD PLASTIC                                                                           1000/CS NO BID 30.27 37.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.40 NO BID 31.29 NO BID NO BID

75 POLISH, STAINLESS STEEL, AEROSOL 12/CS NO BID 29.47 54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.50 NO BID 57.49 NO BID NO BID

76 SALAD HINGED CONTAINERS, 12 OZ. 300 NO BID 93.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 34.25-200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

77 SALAD,HINGED CONT. 24 OZ. DOMED LIDS 126 NO BID 22.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 48.74- 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

78 SANITARY NAPKINS, MAXITHINS - 250/CASE                                                                             250/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.88 NO BID 45.59 NO BID NO BID

79 DELIMER GALLONS 4/CASE NO BID NO BID 59.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.74 NO BID 48.30 NO BID NO BID

80 SOAP,  DISH DETERGENT  38 OZ. JOY OR EQUAL                                                                       4/CS NO BID 50.77 39.80-8/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.17-8 NO BID 47.14 /8 NO BID NO BID

81 SOAP, LURON HAND & BODY   4 GAL/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.00 39.92/8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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82 TEASPOONS, HD PLASTIC - 1000/CASE                                                                             1000/CS NO BID 12.97 22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.35 NO BID 17.49 NO BID NO BID

83 TABLECLOTHS, PLASTIC, RED, 40" X 100' /ROLL                                                                    ROLL NO BID 10.99 10.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.82 NO BID NO BID

84 TABLECLOTHS, PLASTIC, WHITE, 40"X300' / ROLL                                                                       ROLL NO BID 10.99 10.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.87 NO BID 23.25 NO BID NO BID

85 TISSUE, BATHROOM, TORK ADVANCED, 2PLY, 500/ROL
L - 96/CASE   4.5" x 3.75" 96/CS NO BID 28.97 36.50 28.90 NO BID NO BID 32.38 NO BID 58.53 NO BID NO BID

86 TOWELS, PAPER, INDUS ROLL, WHITE (FITS GPC-
P8VUALL DISPENSER) - 12/CASE 12/CASE NO BID 13.97 18.50-6/CASE 16.80 NO BID NO BID 19.72 /6 NO BID 35.44 NO BID NO BID

87 TOWELS, PAPER, HOUSEHOLD, WHITE 30/CS NO BID 18.90 22.50/12/250 15.87 NO BID NO BID 15.80 NO BID 33.74 NO BID NO BID

88 TOWELS, PAPER, MULTIFOLD, WHITE 9X9 4000/CS NO BID 13.97 17.90 12.99 NO BID NO BID 16.92 NO BID 31.11 12.95 /4008 NO BID

89 TOWELS, PAPER, HOUSEHOLD PREMIUM,  K-CLARK 
OR EQUAL CASE NO BID NO BID 52.50-30/36 NO BID NO BID NO BID 79.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

90 TOWELS, PAPER WIPERS, K-CLARK WIPERS, K-CLARK 
OR EQUAL 12X15 WHITE 24/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 89.8 - 1008 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

91 TOWELS, TORK, ADVANCED 30/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 41.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

92 TOWELS, PAPER WIPERS, SCOTTCLOTH, 12X16 800/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

93 TOWELS, PAPER, C-PULL, KCLARK WHITE OR EQUAL 2400/CS NO BID 13.89 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.96 NO BID 35.71 NO BID NO BID

94 TOWELS, 600’ ROLL 6/CS NO BID 21.47 19.90/800' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 38.50 NO BID NO BID

95
TOWELS, FITS GP 54050 CENTERPULL SYSTEM, 
CAREFREE CHOICE SERIES, 2 PLY CENTERFOLD 
TOWEL, 600 F', 6 ROLLS 6/CASE NO BID 26.73 18.80-12/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

96 TRASH CAN DOLLY, CONTINENTAL MFG, BLACK                                                  EACH NO BID 14.91 27.90 NO BID 26.89 NO BID 18.42 NO BID 60.76 NO BID NO BID

97 TRASH CAN 55 GALLON, HUSKEE / BRUTE, CON-
TINENTAL MFG, GRAY EACH NO BID 39.69 54.00 NO BID 47.89 62.00 NO BID NO BID 93.05 NO BID NO BID

98 URINAL SCREEN 12/CASE NO BID 11.89 19.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.27 /10 NO BID 36.31 /6 NO BID NO BID

99 UTENSIL COMBO KIT, PLASTIC, WRAPPED                                             1000/CASE NO BID 8.98 13.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.98 /250 NO BID 23.00 /250 NO BID NO BID

100 WINDEX GALLONS 12/CASE NO BID 38.79 39.00-4/cs NO BID NO BID 36.00 4GAL/CS34.87 /4 NO BID 55.81 /4GAL NO BID NO BID

101 WRAP, FOOD GRADE FILM, 35 GAUGE18"X2000' EACH NO BID 12.49 15.80 13.99 NO BID NO BID 15.18 NO BID 28.11 11.49 NO BID

102 WRINGER, CONTINENTAL  ( FITS CNT-404-3 MOP 
BUCKET) EACH NO BID 39.89 92.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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